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I would like to emphasize my feeling and thoughts during my stay in Stuttgart and to 
summarize my experience during making my bachelor thesis.  
 
During my stay I learnt a lot of things and gained much experience. Staying away of 
our families taught us how to depend on ourselves. I learnt how to face problems and 
deal with them without asking my parents about everything. In Egypt, life is centered 
in Cairo, so most students do not need to travel in order to study. This is not the case 
in Germany, where most of the students need to travel to study in different cities, so 
they gain more experience, especially, the cooking and cleaning experience.  
 
It was a great opportunity to meet the students of the international student groub 
Culture Connection. They taught us about Germany and we taught them about Egypt. 
Also, they gave us a chance to practice the German language. Also, our professors 
and supervisors were very cooperative and friendly with us.  
 
Before going to Germany, I was impressed by the German system and how it is 
successful. I thought that the reason behind the German success is being perfect in 
everything. But after staying in Germany, I discovered that being successful does not 
need to be perfect but it needs good will and knowledge. I learnt this from the 
German system, it is not perfect as some people think but it depends on determination 
and awareness.  
 
Also, I learnt never to believe stereotypes. Everywhere with any people, there are 
some bad people and other good and nice people. The same goes to Germany, I met 
some unfriendly people but, on the other hand, most of the people two I met were 
very nice, helpful and treated me in a very good manner.  
 
The third lesson I learnt from the German people, is to make the work time 
completely for work and to make leisure time completely for leisure. Some people 
mix both times, so they lose the efficiency of work and the pleasure of leisure.  
I wish I will have other opportunity to study in Germany, especially is Stuttgart 
because Stuttgart is a very nice city and I loved it more than any other German city.  
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